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Learn how to make three-
dimensional quilted fabric sculptures.  
In this 6-hour class you will make a 
quilted vase, bowl, or flower, but with 
the technique taught in this class, you 
can create many different quilted 3D 
shapes.  Your imagination is the 
limit...	
Kit fee is $15. The kit contains: heat-
moldable batting (enough to make 
several bowls/flowers or one vase 
and one flower), pattern and 
instructions.	

Supply List:	
1 yard or 2 half yards of cotton fabric 
in desired colors for your vase or 
bowl. The flowers require 1-2 yards of 
fabric (Hand-dyed fabric will be for 
sale in class.)	
Sewing machine with free-motion 
quilting foot and walking foot; sewing 
supplies: scissors, pins, threads to 
match your fabric; rotary cutter and 
mat; needle for hand sewing: fabric 
glue; optional -embellishments (yarn, 
beads); heat gun (optional).	
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